
 

 
 
 
 

PUBLIC APPOINTMENTS TO BOARDS, COMMITTEES AND CORPORATIONS 
 
 
Beautification Committee 
The role of the Beautification Committee is to make recommendations for the development and 
implementation of strategies and plans for community beautification initiatives. The Beautification 
Committee aims to showcase community pride through ongoing initiatives fueled by public engagement 
and business sponsorships.  The Committee will focus on first impressions whether it be for tourists, new 
residents and new businesses that are either considering to establish or simply visiting.  The Committee 
will be comprised of two members of Council, 2 to 4 members of the public, one staff resource person 
while establishing partnerships with the Kapuskasing Horticultural Society, Green TK, service clubs and 
businesses.  The resource staff person is the Recreation Director. 
 
(BIA) Business Improvement Area Board of Management is comprised of six members, four elected by 
the Downtown Merchants Association and two Councillors.  The BIA meets four times per year. The 
business improvement area covers the following areas, Circle, Queen Street from the Circle to Dallyn 
Avenue, Cain Avenue from Riverside Drive to the Circle and as far as the old Bucovetsky’s, McPherson 
from the Circle to Riverside Drive and Byng Avenue from Riverside Drive to Queen Street. The BIA levy 
requisition was for $30,000 which is raised from within the BIA based on share of business levy and funds 
are utilized for improvement projects and for promotion of the area.  The resource staff persons are the 
CAO and the Clerk. 
 
Kapuskasing and District Planning Board is comprised of seven members, two Councillors, four citizen 
members and one provincial appointee. The Board meets four times per year. The Board is responsible 
to advise Council on planning matters such as official plan and zoning by-law amendments. The Board 
resource staff person is the Chief Building Official. 
 
Kapuskasing Municipal Non-Profit Housing Corporation is administered by the Housing Services 
department of the Cochrane District Social Services Administration Board and is comprised of seven 
members, six citizens and one Councillor. The Corporation meets 10 times per year.  The Corporation 
oversees the Grandvue Seniors Building at 32 McPherson Avenue.  
 
Kapuskasing Police Services Board will soon change to representation from the municipalities of 
Opasatika, Val Rita-Harty, Moonbeam, Fauquier-Strickland and Kapuskasing, including two provincially 
appointed members and two community appointed members in Kapuskasing.  The new board composition 
will be in place in 2023. The municipality has a policing services contract with the Ontario Provincial Police 
and the 2022 budget is $2,052,223.  The resource persons are the CAO, General Manager of Protective 
Services and the Clerk, as the Board Secretary.  
  



 

Kapuskasing Public Library Board Council has agreed that the composition of the Board be reduced to 
five members, three citizens and two Councillors. The Board meets 10 times per year. The Library mission 
statement is to provide a comfortable and enjoyable learning atmosphere for all members of the 
Kapuskasing community. The municipality contributed $142,800 to the Library operations, pays the cost 
of liability insurance, building maintenance and utilities which amount to a budgeted amount of $36,290 
for 2022. 
 
Senior’s Advisory Committee 
The advisory committee will provide recommendations and advice to Council on matters which have a 
direct or indirect impact on seniors in the community.  The committee will be responsible for matters such 
as helping to identify needs of seniors, potential opportunities on initiatives and/or projects to promote 
healthy senior lifestyle, identify barriers and overcome barriers for seniors, promote awareness and 
education, support partnerships and funding opportunities. The committee is to be comprised of two 
members of Council, 2 to 4 members representing seniors and one staff resource person. 
 
Youth Advisory Committee 
The advisory committee will provide recommendations and advice to Council on matters which have a 
direct or indirect impact on youth in the community.  The committee will be responsible for matters such 
as helping to identify needs of youth, potential opportunities on initiatives and/or projects to promote youth 
engagement, identify barriers and overcome barriers for youth, support partnerships and funding 
opportunities. The committee is to be comprised of two members of Council, 2 to 4 members representing 
youth from each high school and one staff resource person. 
 
Citizen Advisory Committee 
The Citizen Advisory Committee will provide recommendations and advice to Council on matters which 
have a direct or indirect impact on community well-being which includes diversity, inclusion, equality, 
welcoming newcomers and civic pride.  The Committee will be responsible for matters such as helping to 
identify needs of the community, potential opportunities and partnerships, including funding opportunities 
to promote civic pride, identify barriers and enhance the community’s first impression and citizen 
engagement in the community.  The committee is to be comprised of two members of Council, and 2 to 4 
citizens of Kapuskasing. 
 
The Senior’s, Youth and Citizen Advisory Committees can work as one committee of Council to provide 
recommendations. 
 
Sports Palace Bar Operating Committee is comprised of one council member, nine members of 
community and the resource staff is Marc Clavelle.  The committee oversees the operation of the bar 
under the Sports Palace liquor permit. 
 
 
 


